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Eha ity Uil ACCOUNTING
Name of Grantee/Contractor: Mountains Recreation [Agreement Number: 12-104 Invoice Number: 4
and Conservation Authority
Address (include zip code): Project Name: Malibu Coastal Access Public Works Plan
570 West Avenue 26, Suite 100 '
Los Angeles, CA 90065 Billing Period Covered:
From: 5/1/2014 To: 6/30/2014
Work Plan Task Number and Name Task Budget Costs Incurred | Total Costto | Remaining
(insert rows as needed for work plan) g this Period Date Balance
1. Project Management & Administration $ 164,009.00 | $ 14,315.35 | $§ 73,051.16 | $ . 90,957.84
2. Consultants $ 30599100 |$ - me$ 91.083:00 | $§ 214,928.00
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TOTAL $ 470,000.00 6346035 | $ 164-112.16 | $ 305,885.84
LESS Ten (10%) Percent Withhold $ hjm Attach all receipts of expen- ’
(if applicable) [ditures , Progress Report &
other supporting documents
TOTAL AMOUNT REQUESTED $—m e e

CERTIFICATION OF GRANTEE/CONTRACTOR

I hereby certify that the above costs were incurred in the performance of work required under the agreement and are
consistent with the amounts evidenced by supporting documents and expenditures.

,&a@‘/ Jeff V Jones, Assistant Financial Officer 3 h"”'f
Signatu Printed Name and Title Date
Dir. Cost (BAB) S 7 ,(L L OR STATE COASTAL CONSERVANCY USE ONLY) # (3 us). 85
ndir. Cost(on BAB) S (G,345. 2)
lotal Amt. Requested $_C7 ¥ g ] ‘ AGREEMENT * ﬁ’ 57 100Gl
EXPENDITURE APPROVALS ! ) &
‘e

for this disbursement have been met.

The undersigned certifies that all conditions precedent to dlsbursement and all other legal prerequisites

a4 "
Appm\%tﬂquested: /jgal comnz%, J/ est Approved
Project Manager Work Gfoly Leader Executlve Officer
Budget Iltem: ( Project/Program:

137¢0-2¢ - G029 (1) (2200 Q?M @“ﬁ“j

MRCA Project # 24.401.441.3317.353.21 1402
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GRANTEE/CONTRACTOR DIRECT EXPENDITURE:
(A) Materials and Equipment Reference Amount
Mileage 1 $ 4357
Brushing Equipment Maintenance 1 $ 50.60 j
MRCA Equipment Usage 1 $ 285.00 |
SUB-TOTAL (A)| $ 379.11
(B) Labor - Description Reference |Amount
Total Labor - MRCA Planning Staff 1 $ 12,118.47
Total Indirect - MRCA Planning Staff 1 $ 1,817.77
$ s
$ i
$ )
Ll
SUB-TOTAL (B)| $ 13,936.24
(C) SUB-CONTRACTOR'S EXPENDITURE:
Name Reference Amount
Bionic Landscapes, Inc 2 $ ¢ Ll;;z.go 00 »
KOA Corp 2 $ 2,1?'(}5.{'.10L
Hennon Surveying & Mapping 2 $ 32‘950_00,-
Penfield & Smith 2 $ 9.329.00V
SUB-TOTAL(c)| ¢ e) [26.5° s

GRAND TOTAL (A+B+C)*|
NOTE: (1) * Should agree with "Total Costs Incurred This Period" on front page.
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Kemmler, Kara@cc

From: Kemmler, Kara@SCC

Sent: Tuesday, January 13, 2015 3:26 PM
To: Garcia, Ailene@SCC

Subject: RE: invoice approval GA#12-104

hi Ailene,

I'm told the grantee has rec’d, signed and is sending the amendment back to us today, extending the completion date, so I am
resending invoice #3 to you approved along with invoice #4 for the period of 5/1/14-6/30/14 in the amount of $57,106.66
(after the 10% withholding). Please process these once the amendment is executed.

and please aall or email me if you have any other problems/questions.

thanks!

kara

~~~~~ Original Message-----

From: Garcia, Ailene@SCC

Sent: Monday, January 05, 2015 9:14 AM
To: Kemmler, Kara@sCC

Subfect: RE: invoice approval GA#12-104

Hi Kar,
Do you want me to send the invoice back to you or to the Grantee?
Ailene

————— Original Message-----
From: Kemmler, Kara@sCC
Sent: Friday, January 02, 2015 11:02 AM
To: Garcia, Ailene@scC -
Subject: RE: invoice approval GA#12-104

Ailene,

Thanks for the note below. I double checked and you're correct. | have no idea why the date was jan. 2014, it appears to be 3
mistake since the term date is april 2015. that’s what happens when you're remote and you don't get to sign off on the final draft
before it gets sent out. | am sending up a modification form to amend the agreement and change the date, but Joan is out sick
this week so I'm not sure when it will be processed. can we hold the invoice until this is resolved or do we have to reject it?
thanks,

kara

From: Garcia, Ailene@sCC

Sent: Monday, December 29, 2014 10:20 AM
To: Kemmler, Kara@5CC

Subject: RE: invoice approval GA#12-104

Hi Kara,

| received the invoices today. Invoice #2 looks fine but for invoice #3 (billing period: 1/1/14-4/30/14), the completion date
expired on 1/31/14. Please double check.

Thanks,
Ailene

----- Original Message-----
From: Kemmler, Kara@s5CC
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Kemmler, Kara@SCC

From: Russell Witmyer [russell.witmyer@mrca.ca.gov]

Sent: Tuesday, January 06, 2015 9:34 AM

To: Kemmier, Kara@SCC

Cc: ‘Jessica Nguyen'

Subject: RE: SCC #12-104 Malibu Coastal Access PWP T3371 Inv #4
Attachments: Revised (2) Bionic Invoice #2 2014-04 thru 2014-05_pdf
Kara,

"Equipment Usage”
Purpose: MRCA vehicles are used primarily to transport personnel, materials and tools to the site.
The primary tool used by personnel was the gas-powered chainsaw that was used to clear portions of brush at the Clark
site.
Rate: MRCA personnel spent 44 hrs on 05/25/14 and 10 hrs on 06/08/14, for a total of 54 direct hours.
The allocation of vehicle costs are based on direct hours, thus for that time period, 54 hrs @ $5.28/hr = $285.00
- (Note: these allocation costs are considerably lower that charged by
CalTrans)

Sincerely,

Russell Witmyer
Project Analyst 111

Mountains Recreation and Conservation Authority
570 W Ave 26, Ste 100
Los Angeles, CA 90065

(323) 221-9944 x118
(323) 221-9933 fax
russelL.witmyer@mrca.ca.gov




